
  

10 Reasons Why You Should Join a  
Prince’s Trust Team programme! 

Join our Beeston team now!  The next Team starts on 23rd May 2016 
 
 

   Phone:  Tracey on 07967690741 
   Email:  tracey.avery@notts-fire.gov.uk 
 

Committing to a 12 week 
course not only shows 
employers that you are 
motivated, it gets you into 
the habit of getting up for 
something everyday! 
 
 
 
 
Nottinghamshire Fire and 
Rescue Service and the 
Prince’s Trust are highly 
respected organisations.  
This will help you arrange 
a work placement in a 
career area of your choice! 
 
 

 
We go on an action 
packed residential to the 
Peak District, where you 
will get to try new things, 
push your self to the max 
and get to know the other 
people on your team.  
 

 
 
Whilst on the programme 
you will work towards a 
Level 1 or Level 2 
qualification, which can 
help you gain access to 
college as well as 
impressing employers. 
 
 
 
There are many benefits 
of being part of a team.  
The Team programme will 
help you brush up on your 
team building skills, and 
together, everyone really 
does achieve more! 

1.  Get yourself motivated 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

2.  Get your foot through the door 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 

3.  Go on an action packed residential 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 

4.  Gain a qualification 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 

5.  Become a team player 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Not only will we support 
you with your CV, we will 
also help you fill it with lots 
of achievements which are 
guaranteed to impress any 
employer! 
 
 
 
 
With around 15 people on 
every team, you will meet 
loads of new people and 
make new friends.  Our 
Team members come to 
think of each other as 
family after 12 weeks 
together! 
 
 
Job searching can be very 
difficult and disheartening.  
We will help you gain 
confidence, develop a 
sense of pride, and show 
you how to get this across 
to employers.   
 
 

 
It wont cost you a penny to 
come on our Team 
programme and what is 
more, we can even pay 
your bus fare to cover the 
cost of you getting in 
everyday. 
 
 
 
Whether your completing 
a community project, or 
taking adults with learning 
disabilities to the zoo, 
there are many 
opportunities to give 
something back to your 
local community. 

6.  Brush up on your CV 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

7.  Meet new people 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 

8.  Gain confidence and self esteem 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 

9.  Its free!!! 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 

10.  Do something positive with your life 
 
 
 
 
 
 


